
 

This email message has been approved by Human Resources. 
 

 THE 2009-2010 SHIRT CONTRACT 
 

               EFFECTIVE IMMEDIATELY 

                FOR ALL DEPARTMENTS 

 

The Shirt Contract has been split between two vendors: 

 The Student Body: Contract UC200934-1  

 The Liddle Sport Shop: Contract UC200934-2 

 

Contact information is on the following pages.   

Please print the pages for future reference including pricing.  

 

Please fill out a Performance Survey after you receive your order and send it to Kay Nicholson, Purchasing, 

SSB or email to kayn@mwmissouri.edu. 

 

If you have any questions, please contact Kay Nicholson x1572 

 

Thank you for your cooperation! 

 

mailto:kayn@mwmissouri.edu


SHIRT CONTRACT 

MAY 8, 2009 THROUGH MAY 7, 2010 

                                         Purchase Requisition (PR) required for orders  No “P” Cards or Direct Pay       

 

***ALL DEPARTMENTS:*** 
Please e-mail ALL LOGO SHIRT  DESIGNS to Teresa Carter, University Relations, for approval BEFORE ORDERING.  

 

QUESTIONS: CONTACT KAY NICHOLSON/PURCHASING/X1572 
 

            THE STUDENT BODY 

       Contract Number:  UC200934-1 

 

           Vendor ID 919063150         

             

                                        202 E. Third 

                                 Maryville, MO 64468 

 

                          Contact: Jim Goecken 

                           Phone: 660-582-8889 

                             Fax: 660-582-8317 

Email: studentbody@embarqmail.com 

 

Items awarded: (use commodity code 20070) 

 POLO/GOLF SHIRTS 

 SWEATSHIRTS: REGULAR, HOODED,  ZIP 

FRONT 

 HENLEYS: LONG SLEEVED 

 INK COLORS FOR ALL SCREEN PRINTS 

 EMBROIDERY COLORS FOR ALL ITEMS 

 20% DISCOUNT FOR CATALOG ITEMS 

 

 

 

             THE LIDDLE SPORT SHOP 

            Contract Number:  UC200934-2 

 

Vendor ID 919351247 

  

1006 Main Street 

Blue Springs, MO 64015 

 

Contact:  John Dunn 

Phone: 816-229-3606 

   Fax: 816-228-4000 

       Email: john@liddlesports.com 

 

Items awarded: (use commodity code 20070) 

 T-SHIRTS: SHORT/LONG SLEEVED 

           DRY FIT 

 DENIM SHIRTS 

 HENLEYS: SHORT SLEEVED 

 WINDSHIRTS 

 INK COLORS FOR ALL SCREEN PRINTS 

 EMBROIDERY COLORS FOR ALL ITEMS 

 25% DISCOUNT FOR CATALOG ITEMS



 

 
 

Performance Survey for Shirt Contract 
 

 
In order to monitor and document the performance of vendors for the Shirt Contract,  

each time you have an order filled by Student Body or Liddle Sport Shop, please fill out this form and 

return to Kay Nicholson/Purchasing/SSB.   

 

Purchase Requisition (PR) ________________ 

 

My purchase was made from:      Student Body    Liddle Sport Shop   

  

I purchased:  T-Shirts   Polo Shirts   Sweatshirts   Denim   Windshirts   Other 

 

I ordered (quantity):  1
st
 item_________   2

nd
 item _________   3

rd
 item_________ 

 

I ordered by:        Visiting Vendor        Fax        Phone        Email 

 

 

Using 1 as an EXCELLANT experience and 5 a POOR experience, please rate the following by circling 

your preference: 

 

Ordering Process:        1        2        3        4        5 

Comments: _________________________________________________ 

_______________________________________________________________________ 

_______________________________________________________________________ 

 

Delivery:  1        2        3        4        5 

Comments on Timing and Correctness of order: 

_______________________________________________________________________ 

 ______________________________________________________________________ 

_______________________________________________________________________ 

 ______________________________________________________________________ 

_______________________________________________________________________ 

_______________________________________________________________________ 

 

Overall Experience:   1        2        3        4        5   

Comments: _____________________________________________________________ 

_______________________________________________________________________ 

_______________________________________________________________________ 

                                                             

            

            

    Thank you for your cooperation! 

 

 

 
               



 

 

 Shirt Colors or Number of Colors Available: _____Chart Included_________________________________________________ 

 

1.4   DRY FIT, SHORT SLEEVED, Single color, 100% polyester, 6-8 oz, blank, rib knit collar /white tipping, no tag neck, raglan sleeve 
White S-XL XXL XXXL Lt Colors S-XL XXL XXXL Dk Colors S-XL XXL XXXL 

1 - 25 20.00 22.00 23.00 1 - 25 20.50 22.50 24.50 1 - 25 21.00 23.00 25.00 

26 - 100 18.00 No bid No bid 26 - 100 18.50 20.50 22.50 26 - 100 19.00 21.00 23.00 

101 - 500 17.00 No bid No bid 101 - 500 17.50 19.50 21.50 101 - 500 18.00 20.00 22.00 

501 -1000 16.00 No bid No bid 501 -1000 16.50 18.50 20.50 501 -1000 17.00 19.00 21.00 

Brand Badger   Style No. 3341       

Shirt Colors or Number of Colors Available: ____Chart Included__________________________________________________ 

 

 

1. POLO/GOLF SHIRTS~STUDENT BODY  
  

 1.1   SHORT SLEEVED, 50% Combed cotton/50% polyester, 7-9 oz., blank, ribbed sleeves and collar, 2-5  buttons on front 
White S-XL XXL XXXL Lt  Colors S-XL XXL XXXL Dk Colors S-XL XXL XXXL 

 1 - 25 7.00 8.00 9.00 1 - 25 7.50 8.50 9.50 1 - 25 8.50 9.50 10.50 

26 - 100 6.50 7.50 8.50 26 - 100 6.50 7.50 8.50 26 - 100 7.50 8.50 9.50 

 101 - 500 5.00 6.00 7.00 101 - 500 6.00 7.00 8.00 101 - 500 6.75 7.75 8.75 

 501 -1000 4.50 5.50 6.50 501 -1000 5.50 5.50 6.50 501 - 1000 6.00 7.00 8.00 

 Brand:  Gildan 

 

  Style No:  8800     

 

      

 Shirt Colors or Number of Colors Available: ____Chart Included___________________________________________________ 
 

 

1.2   SHORT SLEEVED,100% pre-shrunk cotton, 7-9 oz., blank, ribbed sleeves and collar, 2-5 buttons on front 
White S-XL XXL XXXL Lt Colors S-XL XXL XXXL Dk Colors S-XL XXL XXXL 

1 - 25 9.00 10.00 11.00 1 - 25 8.50 9.50 10.50 1 - 25 10.50 11.50 12.50 

26 – 100 8.50 9.50 10.50 26 - 100 7.50 8.50 9.50 26 - 100 9.50 10.50 11.50 

101 – 500 7.00 8.00 9.00 101 - 500 8.00 9.00 10.00 101 - 500 8.75 9.75 10.75 

501 -1000 6.50 7.50 8.50 501 -1000 7.50 8.50 9.50 501 - 1000 8.00 9.00 10.00 

Brand: Gildan   Style No: 36000       

Shirt Colors or Number of Colors Available: ____Chart Included__________________________________________________ 
 

 

 1.3      SHORT SLEEVED, Tri-color, 100% cotton pique style, 6.5 oz., blank, 2-button, ribbed sleeves and collar 
White S-XL XXL XXXL Lt Colors S-XL XXL XXXL Dk Colors S-XL XXL XXXL 

1 - 25 12.00 13.00 14.00 1 - 25 12.50 13.50 14.50 1 - 25 13.50 14.50 15.50 

26 - 100 11.50 12.50 13.50 26 - 100 12.00 13.00 14.00 26 - 100 13.00 14.00 15.00 

101 - 500 11.00 12.00 13.00 101 - 500 11.50 12.50 13.50 101 - 500 12.50 13.50 14.50 

501 -1000 10.00 11.00 12.00 501 -1000 10.50 11.50 12.50 501 -1000 11.00 12.00 13.00 

Brand Harriton   Style No. M250       



 

 

1.5   DRY FIT, SHORT SLEEVED, Color Blocked (2 colors), 100% polyester, 6-8 oz, blank, rib knit collar/white        

        tipping, no tag neck, raglan sleeve                                                                                                                                                                      
White S-XL XXL XXXL Lt Colors S-XL XL XXXL Dk Colors S-XL XXL XXXL 

1 - 25 21.00 23.00 25.00 1 - 25 21.50 23.50 24.00 1 - 25 22.00 24.00 25.00 

26 - 100 20.00 22.00 24.00 26 - 100 21.00 23.00 25.00 26 - 100 21.50 23.50 25.50 

101 - 500 18.00 20.00 22.00 101 - 500 18.00 20.00 22.00 101 - 500 18.50 20.50 22.50 

501 -1000 17.00 19.00 21.00 501 -1000 17.50 19.50 21.50 501 -1000 18.00 20.00 22.00 
Brand Badger   Style No. 3344       

 Shirt Colors or Number of Colors Available: _______Chart Included_______________________________________________ 

 

2.  SWEATSHIRTS~STUDENT BODY 

2.1   50% cotton/50% polyester, medium weight 9-10 oz., blank 

Shirt Colors or Number of Colors Available: _____Chart Included__________________________________________________ 

 

2.2   90% cotton/10% polyester, medium weight 9-10 oz., blank 

Shirt Colors or Number of Colors Available: __Chart Included_____________________________________________________ 

 

2.3    90% cotton/10% polyester, heavy weight 11+oz., blank 
White S-XL XXL XXXL Lt Colors S-XL XL XXXL Dk Colors S-XL XXL XXXL 

1 - 25 17.00 18.00 19.00 1 - 25 18.00 19.50 21.00 1 - 25 19.00 20.00 21.00 

26 - 100 13.00 16.00 17.00 26 - 100 14.00 16.50 18.00 26 - 100 15.00 16.00 17.00 

101 - 500 11.00 12.50 13.50 101 - 500 12.00 13.50 15.00 101 - 500 13.00 14.00 15.00 

501 -1000 10.00 11.50 12.50 501 -1000 11.50 12.50 14.00 501 -1000 12.50 13.50 14.50 

Brand              Fruit of the Loom_________________  Style No.     ____04159______________________ 

Shirt Colors or Number of Colors Available: _______Chart Included____________________________________________ 

 

 

 

White S-XL XXL XXXL Lt Colors S-XL XL XXXL Dk Colors S-XL XXL XXXL 

1 - 25 11.50 12.50 13.50 1 - 25 12.50 14.50 14.40 1 - 25 13.50 15.00 15.40 

26 - 100 9.50 10.50 12.50 26 - 100 10.00 12.00 13.00 26 - 100 11.00 12.50 14.50 

101 - 500 8.00 9.00 10.00 101 - 500 8.50 11.00 12.50 101 - 500 9.50 12.50 11.50 

501 -1000 7.00 8.00 9.00 501 -1000 7.50 9.00 9.50 501 -1000 8.50 10.00 12.50 
Brand Gildan   Style No. 12000       

White S-XL XXL XXXL Lt Colors S-XL XL XXXL Dk Colors S-XL XXL XXXL 

1 - 25 12.00 13.00 14.00 1 - 25 13.00 14.50 14.90 1 - 25 14.00 15.50 15.90 

26 - 100 9.90 10.90 13.00 26 - 100 10.50 12.00 13.50 26 - 100 11.50 13.00 15.00 

101 - 500 8.50 9.50 10.50 101 - 500 9.00 11.50 11.00 101 - 500 10.00 12.50 12.00 

501 -1000 7.50 8.50 9.50 501 -1000 8.00 9.50 10.00 501 -1000 9.00 10.50 11.00 
Brand Gildan   Style No. 9000       



 

 

2.4      Hooded Sweatshirt: 50/50 cotton/polyester: 9-10 oz, blank, double ply hood, front pouch pocket        

 

 

  

 

 

 
Brand         __Gildan______________________________   Style No.     ____12500_____________________________ 

Shirt Colors or Number of Colors Available: __Chart Included__________________________________________________ 

 

2.5     Full Zip Hooded Sweatshirt: 50/50 Cotton/Polyester: 9-10oz, blank, split pouch pocket 

    

 

 

 

 

 
Brand         __Gildan______________________________   Style No.     ____12600_____________________________ 

Shirt Colors or Number of Colors Available: _____Chart Included______________________________________________ 

 

2.6 Hooded Sweatshirt: 80/20 Cotton/Polyester, 9-10oz, blank, double lined hood, rib knit cuffs & bottom band 
 

 

 

 

 

 
 

Brand         ___Gildan_____________________________   Style No.     ____9500_____________________________ 

Shirt Colors or Number of Colors Available: ____Chart Included__________________________________________________ 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

White S-XL XXL XXXL Lt Colors S-XL XL XXXL Dk Colors S-XL XXL XXXL 

1 - 25 15.50 16.50 17.50 1 - 25 16.50 17.50 18.50 1 - 25 17.50 18.50 19.50 

26 - 100 13.50 14.50 15.50 26 - 100 14.50 15.50 16.50 26 - 100 15.50 16.50 17.50 

101 - 500 12.00 13.00 14.00 101 - 500 13.00 14.00 15.00 101 - 500 14.00 15.00 16.00 

501 -1000 11.00 12.00 13.00 501 -1000 12.00 12.00 13.00 501 -1000 13.00 14.00 15.00 

White S-XL XXL XXXL Lt Colors S-XL XL XXXL Dk  Colors S-XL XXL XXXL 

1 - 25 22.00 23.50 25.00 1 - 25 22.50 24.00 25.50 1 - 25 23.00 24.50 26.00 

26 - 100 20.00 21.50 23.00 26 - 100 20.50 22.00 23.50 26 - 100 21.00 22.50 24.00 

101 - 500 18.00 19.50 21.00 101 - 500 18.50 20.00 21.50 101 - 500 19.00 20.50 22.00 

501 -1000 16.00 17.50 19.00 501 -1000 16.50 18.00 19.50 501 -1000 17.00 18.50 20.00 

White S-XL XXL XXXL Lt Colors S-XL XL XXXL Dk Colors S-XL XXL XXXL 

1 - 25 16.00 17.00 18.00 1 - 25 17.00 18.00 19.00 1 - 25 18.00 19.00 20.00 

26 - 100 14.00 15.00 16.00 26 - 100 15.00 16.00 17.00 26 - 100 16.00 17.00 18.00 

101 - 500 12.50 13.50 14.50 101 - 500 13.50 14.50 15.50 101 - 500 14.50 15.50 16.50 

501 -1000 11.50 12.50 13.50 501 -1000 12.50 13.50 14.50 501 -1000 13.50 14.50 15.50 



 

 

2.7   Full Zip Hooded Sweatshirt: 50/50 Cotton/Polyester, 7.75 oz, blank,  unlined hood, rib knit cuffs , split front pouch pocket                                                                                                                                                                         
 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

Shirt Colors or Number of Colors Available: ___Chart Included_______________________________________________ 

 

 

3.    HENLEY~STUDENT BODY 

        3.1   LONG SLEEVE, 100% cotton, 7.1 oz., blank, 3-button, button through 
White S-XL XXL XXXL Lt Colors S-XL XL XXXL Dk Colors S-XL XXL XXXL 

1 - 25 15.00 16.00 17.00 1 - 25 15.50 16.50 17.50 1 - 25 16.00 17.00 18.00 

26 - 100 14.50 15.50 16.50 26 - 100 15.00 16.00 17.00 26 - 100 15.50 16.50 17.50 

101 - 500 13.00 14.00 15.00 101 - 500 13.50 14.50 15.50 101 - 500 14.50 15.50 16.50 

501 -1000 12.00 13.00 14.00 501 -1000 13.00 14.00 15.00 501 -1000 13.50 14.50 15.50 

Brand: Anvil   Style No: 1210       

          Shirt Colors or Number of Colors Available: ___Chart Included_________________________________________________ 

 

 

4.     INK COLORS FOR ALL SCREEN PRINTS/STUDENT BODY 

 

1. Ink colors or number of colors available:  __Mix Colors to clients specs. Any color available__________________________ 

2. Artwork Charge: Hourly Rate:  ________$20  ($50 max)______________________________________________________ 

                                                                                                                                                                                                     

 

 

 

 

 

White S-XL XXL XXXL Lt Colors S-XL XL XXXL Dk Colors S-XL XXL XXXL 

1 - 25 20.00 21.50 23.00 1 - 25 20.50 22.00 23.50 1 - 25 21.00 22.50 24.00 

26 - 100 18.00 19.50 21.00 26 - 100 18.50 20.00 21.50 26 - 100 19.00 20.50 22.00 

101 - 500 16.00 17.50 19.00 101 - 500 16.50 18.00 19.50 101 - 500 17.00 18.50 20.00 

501 -1000 14.00 15.50 17.00 501 -1000 14.50 16.00 17.50 501 -1000 15.00 16.50 18.00 

     Brand Gildan   Style No. 18600       

                   COST PER COLOR ON FRONT                          COST PER COLOR ON BACK 
QTY 1 color 2 colors 3 colors 4 colors 5 colors 6 colors 1 color 2 colors 3 colors 4 colors 5  colors 6 colors 

1-25 1.50 2.00 2.50 3.00 3.50 4.00 1.50 2.00 2.50 3.00 3.50 4.00 

26-100 1.25 1.75 2.25 2.75 3.25 3.50 1.25 1.75 2.25 2.75 3.25 3.75 

101-500 1.00 1.25 1.75 2.25 2.75 3.25 1.00 1.25 1.75 2.25 2.75 3.25 

501-1K .90 1.10 1.50 2.00 2.50 3.00 .90 1.00 1.50 2.00 2.50 3.00 



 

 

5.     EMBROIDERY COLORS FOR ALL ITEMS/STUDENT BODY 

 

 COST FOR STITCH COUNT ON FRONT 

QTY 0-3000 3001-500 5001+ 

1-25 7.00 8.00 9.00 

26-100 6.00 7.00 8.00 

101-500 4.00 4.00 5.00 

501-1000 3.00 3.33 4.00 

 

1.    Thread colors or number of thread colors available: ________Chart Included_________________________ 

 

2.    Artwork Charge: hourly rate:_______$20   ($50 max)_____________________________________________ 

 

3.    Disk Charge: Digitizing for Embroidery:  _______$12 per 1000 Stitches_______________________________ 
 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 



 

 

Shirt Colors or Number of Colors Available: ____8 colors________________________________________ 
 

            6.4   LONG SLEEVED, 100% pre-shrunk cotton, 5-6 oz, blank 
White S-XL XXL XXXL Lt  Colors S-XL XXL XXXL Dk Colors S-XL XXL XXXL 

1 - 25 6.50 7.00 7.00 1 - 25 7.75 9.00 9.00 1 - 25 7.75 9.00 9.00 

26 - 100 5.50 6.00 6.00 26 - 100 6.75 8.00 8.00 26 - 100 6.75 8.00 8.00 

101 - 500 4.25 5.25 5.25 101 - 500 5.50 6.75 6.75 101 - 500 5.50 6.75 6.75 

501 -1000 3.25 4.25 4.25 501 -1000 4.50 5.75 5.75 501 - 1000 4.50 5.75 5.75 

Brand Gildan    Style No.:  5400          

Shirt Colors or Number of Colors Available: ______8 colors_______________________________________

6.  T-SHIRTS~LIDDLE SPORT SHOP 

       
       6.1  SHORT SLEEVED, 50% cotton/50% polyester, 5-6 oz., blank 

White S-XL XXL XXXL Lt Colors S-XL XXL XXXL Dk Colors S-XL XXL XXL 

            1 - 25 4.00 5.00 5.00 1 - 25 4.75 6.00 6.00 1 - 25 4.75 6.00 6.00 

 26 - 100 3.50 4.50 4.50 26 - 100 4.25 5.50 5.50 26 - 100 4.25 5.50 5.50 

 101 - 500 2.75 3.75 3.75 101 - 500 3.50 5.00 5.00 101 - 500 3.50 5.00 5.00 

 501-1000 2.00 3.00 3.00 501 -1000 2.75 4.00 4.00 501 -1000 2.75 4.00 4.00 

 Brand:  Gildan     Style No.:  8000     

 

      

 Shirt Colors or Number of Colors Available: ___30 colors________________________________________ 

 

         6.2  SHORT SLEEVED, 100% pre-shrunk cotton, 5-6 oz., blank 

      White S-XL XXL XXXL Lt Colors S-XL XXL XXXL Dk  Colors S-XL XXL XXXL 

 1 - 25 4.00 5.00 5.00 1 - 25 4.75 6.00 6.00 1 - 25 4.75 6.00 6.00 

 26 - 100 3.50 4.50 4.50 26 - 100 4.25 5.50 5.50 26 - 100 4.25 5.50 5.50 

 101 - 500 2.75 3.75 3.75 101 - 500 3.50 5.00 5.00 101 - 500 3.50 5.00 5.00 

 501 -1000 2.00 3.00 3.00 501 -1000 2.75 4.00 4.00 501 - 1000 2.75 4.00 4.00 

 Brand:  Gildan     Style No.:  5000     

 

      

 Shirt Colors or Number of Colors Available: ____32 colors________________________________________ 

 

         6.3  LONG SLEEVED, 50% cotton/50% polyester, 5-6 oz., blank 
White S-XL XXL XXXL Lt Colors S-XL XXL XXXL Dk Colors S-XL XXL XXXL 

 1 - 25 7.00 8.00 8.00 1 - 25 8.00 9.25 9.25 1 - 25 8.00 9.25 9.25 

 26 - 100 6.00 7.00 7.00 26 - 100 7.00 8.25 8.25 26 - 100 7.00 8.25 8.25 

 101 - 500 4.75 5.75 5.75 101 - 500 5.75 7.00 7.00 101 - 500 5.75 7.00 7.00 

 501 -1000 3.75 4.75 4.75 501 -1000 4.75 6.00 6.00 501 - 1000 4.75 6.00 6.00 

 Brand Gildan 
  

Style No. 8400 
       



                                                                             

 

                                                                     

         

       7.   DENIM SHIRT~LIDDLE SPORT SHOP  

7.1   100% cotton, 7.25 oz., blank,  button down collar, left chest pocket, 2 button cuffs, button through sleeve placket, full cut 
White S-XL XXL XXXL Lt  Colors S-XL XL XXXL Dk Colors S-XL XXL XXXL 

1 - 25 24.95 27.95 27.95 1 - 25 24.95 27.95 27.95 1 - 25 24.95 27.95 27.95 

26 - 100 22.00 25.00 25.00 26 - 100 22.00 25.00 25.00 26 - 100 22.00 25.00 25.00 

101 - 500 20.00 23.00 23.00 101 - 500 20.00 23.00 23.00 101 - 500 20.00 23.00 23.00 

501 -1000 18.00 21.00 21.00 501 -1000 18.00 21.00 21.00 501 -1000 18.00 21.00 21.00 

Brand: Lee   Style No: 7180       

    Shirt Colors or Number of Colors Available: ______3 Colors____________________________________ 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

       6.5   DRY FIT, SHORT SLEEVED, Solid Color, crew neck, no tag neck labeling, 100% polyester, 4-5 oz., blank, set in sleeves 
White S-XL XXL XXXL Lt Colors S-XL XXL XXXL Dk  Colors S-XL XXL XXXL 

1 - 25 7.95 7.95 7.45 1 - 25 7.95 7.95 7.45 1 - 25 7.95 7.95 7.45 

26 - 100 6.95 6.95 8.45 26 - 100 6.95 6.95 8.45 26 - 100 6.95 6.95 8.45 

101 - 500 5.95 5.95 7.45 101 - 500 5.95 5.95 7.45 101 - 500 5.95 5.95 7.45 

501 -1000 5.00 5.00 6.50 501 -1000 5.00 5.00 6.50 501 - 1000 5.00 5.00 6.50 

Brand A4   Style No. N3142       

            Shirt Colors or Number of Colors Available: ____14 Colors___________________________________ 

 

        6.6   DRY FIT, SHORT SLEEVED, Color Blocked (2 colors), 100% polyester, 6-8 oz, blank, rib knit collar /white tipping, no tag 

                neck,  raglan sleeve 
White S-XL XXL XXXL Lt Colors S-XL XL XXXL Dk  Colors S-XL XXL XXXL 

1 - 25 9.95 9.95 11.45 1 - 25 9.95 9.95 11.45 1 - 25 9.95 9.95 11.45 

26 - 100 8.95 8.95 10.45 26 - 100 8.95 8.95 10.45 26 - 100 8.95 8.95 10.45 

101 - 500 7.95 7.95 9.45 101 - 500 7.95 7.95 9.45 101 - 500 7.95 7.95 9.45 

501 -1000 7.00 7.00 8.50 501 -1000 7.00 7.00 8.50 501 -1000 7.00 7.00 8.50 
Brand A4   Style No. N3181       

Shirt Colors or Number of Colors Available: ________8 Colors__________________________________ 

 

 



                                                                             

 

                                                                     

      8.   HENLEY SHIRT~LIDDLE SPORT SHOP   

8.1   SHORT SLEEVE, 100% cotton, 7.1 oz., blank, 3-button, button through 
White S-XL XXL XXXL Lt Colors S-XL XL XXXL Dk Colors S-XL XXL XXXL 

1 - 25 9.95 11.95 11.95 1 - 25 10.80 12.80 12.80 1 - 25 10.80 12.80 12.80 

26 - 100 9.00 11.00 11.00 26 - 100 9.75 11.75 11.75 26 - 100 9.75 11.75 11.75 

101 - 500 8.00 10.00 10.00 101 - 500 8.75 10.75 10.75 101 - 500 8.75 10.75 10.75 

501 -1000 7.00 9.00 9.00 501 -1000 7.75 9.75 9.75 501 -1000 7.75 9.75 9.75 

Brand: Anvil   Style No: 1202       

Shirt Colors or Number of Colors Available: ___7 Colors________________________________________ 

 

    9.  WINDSHIRT~LIDDLE SPORT SHOP 

  9.1 LONG SLEEVED, 100% Sanded Polyester Microfiber shell, 100% polyester taffeta lining, blank, pockets 

 

 

 

 

 

 

Shirt Colors or Number of Colors Available: ____8 Colors__________________________________________ 

 

 

10.    INK COLORS FOR ALL SCREEN PRINTS~LIDDLE SPORT SHOP 

 

                   COST PER COLOR ON FRONT                          COST PER COLOR ON BACK 
QTY 1 color 2 colors 3 colors 4 colors 5 colors 6 colors 1 color 2 colors 3 colors 4 colors 5  colors 6 colors 

1-25 .90 1.05 1.20 1.35 1.55 1.75 .90 1.05 1.20 1.35 1.55 1.75 

26-100 .80 .95 1.10 1.25 1.45 1.65 .80 .95 1.10 1.25 1.45 1.65 

101-500 .65 .80 .95 1.10 1.30 1.55 .65 .80 .95 1.10 1.30 1.55 

501-1K .50 .65 .85 1.00 1.20 1.45 .50 .65 .85 1.00 1.20 1.45 

 

10.1     Ink colors or number of colors available:  _____50+_____________________________________ 

10.2    Artwork Charge: Hourly Rate:  __30 MIN. INCLUDED PER PROJECT___$20/HR AFTER THAT 
 

 

 

  

11.  EMBROIDERY COLORS FOR ALL ITEMS~LIDDLE SPORT SHOP 

White S-XL XXL XXXL Lt Colors S-XL XL XXXL Dk  Colors S-XL XXL XXXL 

1 - 25 24.95 26.95 26.95 1 - 25 24.95 26.95 26.95 1 - 25 24.95 26.95 26.95 

26 - 100 19.50 21.50 21.50 26 - 100 19.50 21.50 21.50 26 - 100 19.50 21.50 21.50 

101 - 500 17.25 19.25 19.25 101 - 500 17.25 19.25 19.25 101 - 500 17.25 19.25 19.25 

501 -1000 16.25 18.25 18.25 501 -1000 16.25 18.25 18.25 501 -1000 16.25 18.25 18.25 

Brand Badger   Style No. 7618       



                                                                             

 

                                                                     

 

 COST FOR STITCH COUNT ON FRONT 

QTY 0-3000 3001-500 5001+ 

1-25 2.88 3.18 4.18 

26-100 2.24 2.54 3.54 

101-500 2.14 2.44 3.44 

501-1000 1.80 2.10 3.10 

 

11.1    Thread colors or number of thread colors available: __________150+_____________________________ 

11.2    Artwork Charge: hourly rate:__30 MIN. INCLUDED PER PROJECT___$20/HR AFTER THAT ________ 

11.3   Disk Charge: Digitizing for Embroidery:  _______$20 PER DESIGN_____________________________ 

 


